
 

 

Effective 1/1/2024 

Terms and Conditions of Purchase 

As used herein, “You” or “Seller” means the vendor named in the Purchase Order 

accompanying these Terms and Conditions and “We” or “Trans Cable” means 

TransCable International, Inc., a Texas corporation 

1.       Acceptance of Orders; Complete Agreement; Changes: You may accept an 
Order which will also constitute acceptance of all the terms and conditions herein, by 
signing and returning the Order or a copy of it to us, or by delivering the Goods, or by 
otherwise indicating your acceptance.  
The Order, when accepted, constitutes the complete and exclusive agreement and 
understanding between us relating to the subject matter hereof and supersedes all prior 
agreements, understandings or statements, oral or written, for the same goods, 
including the terms or conditions contained in your proposal or quotation, unless those 
terms and conditions are expressly identified by topic or paragraph number and 
expressly accepted by us on the face side of the Order.  

The Order expressly limits acceptance to the terms and conditions stated herein.  

We object to and reject all past or future additional or inconsistent terms or conditions 
proposed by you, in documents, by writings accompanying or printed on the Goods, or 
in any document tendered as responsive to the Order, unless we expressly indicate our 
consent in writing.  
You may not assume that our silence in response to any of your past or future 
documents or writings, even if coupled with our acceptance of your Goods, indicates our 
acceptance of such terms or conditions.  

IT IS YOUR RESPONSIBILITY TO OBTAIN EXPRESS WRITTEN CONSENT IF YOU 
WISH TO MODIFY ANY OF THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE ORDER.  

We reserve our right to withdraw the Order at any time without obligation until we 
receive a written acceptance of the Order or delivery of the Goods.  
We shall have the right at any time to make changes to drawings, designs, 
specifications, materials, packaging, time and place of delivery and method of 
transportation.  
If any such changes cause an increase or decrease in the cost or time required for 
performance, you must notify us within fifteen (15) days of your receipt of the requested 
change. We will not be responsible for any additional costs unless we have specifically 
approved those costs in writing.  Any claim by you for additional costs shall be waived 
unless asserted in writing within fifteen (15) days of your receipt of the requested 
change. In the event of any inconsistencies between the terms and conditions herein 
and the face side of the Order, the face side of the Order controls. 



 

 

 

 

 

2.       Non-Exclusivity: You acknowledge and agree that we are always free to 
purchase the same or similar Goods from other suppliers as we may determine in our 
sole discretion and/or to manufacture the Goods or similar products ourselves. 

3.       Price/Payment: Unless set forth in a separate line on the face of the Order, the 
Purchase Price includes all packaging; transportation costs; insurance; customs duties 
and fees; and sales, use or other applicable taxes. Trans Cable reserves the right to 
deduct or withhold from the Purchase Price any taxes, levies or other amounts required 
to be withheld or deducted by us in accordance with applicable law. You represent that 
any taxes charged on Goods will be promptly remitted to the designated jurisdiction and 
that you are authorized and properly registered with the jurisdiction taxing authorities to 
collect, and remit said taxes. You shall provide to us prices, terms, and warranties for 
the Goods no less favorable than the terms being offered by you to any of your present 
customers purchasing such goods.  

In the event Trans Cable makes progress payments to Seller, Trans Cable shall have 
title to the Goods to the extent of the progress payments made. If the Goods or Services 
are purchased over a period of time, Trans Cable hereunder reserves the right to obtain 
more competitive prices for comparable goods or services.  

Trans Cable shall have the right to terminate the Purchase Order with no liability and to 
purchase the Goods or Services from such other vendor.  

4.       Delivery: All Goods shall be delivered on or before the Delivery Date and packed 
for shipment in suitable containers/pallets and in accordance with good commercial 
practices. Title to and risk of loss of the Goods shall pass to us upon our acceptance of 
the Goods. If you fail to make a delivery of Goods in accordance with the terms of the 
Order, in addition to any other remedies Trans Cable may have, we have the right to 
cancel the Order for any Goods not yet shipped without payment of any penalty, fee or 
other amounts of any kind, and you shall pay the cost of cover.  

Each package shall be labeled with our Purchase Order number, Part Number; shall 
contain an itemized packing slip and shall be properly marked and packed to avoid loss 
or damage in transit and delivery. No charge will be allowed for packing, carting, freight, 
express or cartage unless expressly so specified on the face of the Order. 

 

 



 

 

 

5.       Terms: We will pay the undisputed portions of each invoice within sixty (60) days 
of its receipt. All payments will be in U.S. dollars and made by wire transfer or corporate 
check. 

6.       Setoff: We reserve the right to withhold, deduct or set off amounts owed to us by 
you in respect of the Order or any other transaction from any amounts due from us to 
you in respect of the Order. 

7.       Inspection; Acceptance: We have the right to inspect the Goods, irrespective of 
any prior payment. We may reject, refuse acceptance and/or request a replacement of 
Goods not in accordance with terms of the Order and elect, in addition to any other 
remedies we may have, a full refund, including, without limitation, handling and 
transportation charges incurred in connection with the return. 

8.       Warranties: You expressly warrant that the Goods shall be delivered to us free of 
any lien, claim or encumbrance; be of new and merchantable quality for a period of 12 
months after acceptance; and conform to the specifications set forth on the face of the 
Order, any samples provided to us and applicable law. You further expressly warrant 
that any services provided in connection with the Goods shall be performed in a 
professional and workmanlike manner and that none of the Goods or services provided 
hereunder violates any patent, trademark, copyright, trade secret, or any other 
intellectual property right of any third party. No inspection, testing, acceptance or use of 
the Goods will affect your obligations under these warranties. Your warranties shall run 
to us, our successors, assigns and customers, and users of products sold by us. You 
also make all warranties as provided in the Uniform Commercial Code. 

9.       Compliance with Law: You expressly represent that in connection with the 
delivery of the Goods and services hereunder, you have complied and shall comply with 
all laws, rules and regulations, including, without limitation, those relating to bribery; 
corruption; sanctions; and the importation, exportation, re-exportation or sale of any 
Goods. 

10.    Indemnification: You shall defend, indemnify and hold us harmless from any 
claim, liability, loss, damage, cost or expense (including reasonable attorneys’ fees) 
arising out of or relating to your breach of any warranty, covenants or obligations under 
the Order; your wrongful or allegedly wrongful act, or failure to act, in connection with 
the Order, whether such commission or omission was intentional, negligent or 
otherwise; or any actual or alleged infringement, misappropriation or violation of any of 
our intellectual property rights. We will promptly notify you upon our receipt of notice of 
any such claim or proceeding, and you shall, at your expense, assume the defense of 
such claim. We may participate in such a defense, at our option, and reserve the right to 
reject any settlement that imposes any liability on us or does not release us from liability 
unconditionally. 



11. Insurance: Seller will, at its own expense, procure and maintain in full force and
effect, for a period of no less than two (2) years following the supply of Goods or
completion of Services, or both if applicable, through companies and agencies
satisfactory to Buyer, the following insurance coverage, unless varied by an applicable
written amendment executed by both parties: (a) Workers’ Compensation Insurance in
Seller’s name with limits that satisfy the state requirements where the Services are
being performed. (b) Employer’s Liability Insurance with limits not less than $1,000,000
per occurrence. (c) Comprehensive General liability insurance, including Contractual
Liability Insurance in Seller’s name and Broad Form Property Damage, with not less
than $2,000,000 per occurrence Combined Single Limit. (d) Automobile Liability
Insurance with an employer’s Non-Ownership Liability Endorsement in Seller’s name,
with not less than $1,000,000 per occurrence Combined Single Limit. The insurance
policies described in (c) and (d) above shall name Trans Cable as an additional insured
and shall afford Trans Cable with primary coverage, irrespective of other coverage
maintained by Buyer or Seller, and Seller’s self-insurance retention in (c) and (d) above
shall not exceed $100,000. The seller shall be responsible for maintaining insurance
covering its personal property used by it in its work and shall be solely responsible for
damage to or loss of same from any cause. Seller hereby waives, and shall cause it
insurers to waiver, all rights of subrogation against Buyer. BEFORE THE SELLER
BEGINS WORK HEREUNDER, A CERTIFICATE EVIDENCING THE ABOVE-
DESCRIBED INSURANCE COVERAGE SHALL BE DEPOSITED WITH A BUYER
MARKED FOR THE ATTENTION OF: PURCHASING AGENT, BUYER, AT THE
ADDRESS OF THE ORDERING FACILITY. Such certifications of insurance shall
require at least thirty (30) days’ prior written notice to Trans Cable before cancellation,
termination, or modification of the coverage specified therein. Seller must further certify
to the Purchasing Agent of Trans Cable that it has obtained similar Certificates of
Insurance from each of its subcontractors before their work commences and, upon
request of Trans Cable, copies of the declaration pages of Seller and such
subcontractor. Each subcontractor must be covered by insurance of the same character
and in the same amounts as Seller, unless Trans Cable and Seller mutually agree that
reduced coverage is adequate due to the nature of the subcontract work.

12. Termination: We may terminate the Order and seek damages allowed by law
upon fourteen (14) days’ written notice if you breach your obligations hereunder, and
that breach remains uncured during the 14-day notice period. Upon termination of the
Order, you shall return to us (or, at our option, certify to the destruction of) all materials
and any other documents or materials belonging to or produced for us by you or by any
third party, including all confidential information. Termination shall not affect any existing
obligation under the Order.



13. Confidentiality: You shall consider all information we furnish to be confidential,
and you agree not to disclose any such information to any other person or entity or use
such information for any purpose other than performing the Order, unless you obtain
express written permission from us to do so. You shall not advertise or publish the fact
that we have contracted to purchase goods from you, nor shall you disclose any
information relating to the Order without Trans Cable’s written permission.

14. Relationship of the Parties: You serve as an independent contractor hereunder,
and not as our employee, joint ventures or partner, and will not by reason of the Order,
or performance hereunder, have or acquire any rights or claims with respect to medical
or other insurance, workers’ compensation, pension or retirement benefits, or other
fringe benefits provided to our employees.

15. Time Is of the Essence: Time is of the essence with respect to all provisions of
the Order.  If delivery of items or rendering of services is not completed by the time set
forth on the face of the Order, we reserve the right, without liability and in addition to our
other rights and remedies, to terminate this Order by notice effective when you receive it
as to items not yet shipped or services not yet rendered and to purchase substitute
items elsewhere and charge you with any loss.

16. Waiver: No modification, amendment or waiver of any provision of the Order shall
be effective unless approved in writing by Trans Cable. Our failure to insist on
performance of any of the terms or conditions herein or to exercise any right or
privilege, or our waiver of any breach hereunder shall not constitute a waiver of any
other terms, conditions or privileges, whether of the same or similar type.

17. Choice of Law: These Terms and Conditions are governed by the laws of the
State of Texas.

18. Severability; Survival; Assignment: The invalidity, illegality or unenforceability
of any provision of the Order shall not affect or impair the validity, legality or
enforceability of the remainder of the Order, and the provisions of the Order are
declared to be severable. Any provisions of the Order, the nature and intent of which is
to survive termination or expiration of the Order, shall survive the expiration or
termination of the Order. You shall not assign, transfer, delegate or subcontract any of
your rights or obligations under the Order without our prior written consent.



19. Labor Disputes: You represent that you are not experiencing and are not
threatened with any labor disputes, and you do not contemplate a strike or other labor
dispute that will in any way jeopardize your performance hereunder.

20. Federal Acquisition Regulation Clauses Incorporated by Reference. The
following clauses from the Federal Acquisition Regulation ("FAR"), 48 C.F.R. Chapter 1,
as applicable and as in effect on the date of this Order, are incorporated by reference
into this order. The full text of the below clauses is available at
http://www.acquisition.gov/far. Unless the context requires otherwise, in the text of the
below clauses the term "Contractor" means “You” or "Seller" and the terms "Contracting
Officer" and "Government" mean “Trans Cable”: (a) Contractor Code of Business Ethics
and Conduct (FAR 52.203-13); (b) Utilization of Small Business Concerns (FAR 52.219-
8); (c)Equal Opportunity (FAR 52.222-26); (d) Equal Opportunity for Veterans (FAR
52.222-35); (e) Affirmative Action for Workers with Disabilities (FAR 52.222-36); (f)
Notification of Employee Rights Under the National Labor Relations Act (FAR 52.222-
40) (applies only if value of order exceeds $10,000 and will be performed wholly or
partially in the United States); and (g) Combating Trafficking in Persons (FAR 52.222-
50)

21. Force Majeure: No party shall be considered in default in the performance of their
obligations under this Order if such performance is prevented or delayed because of
Acts of God or causes which are beyond the reasonable control of the party affected.
However, the party claiming force majeure shall make every reasonable effort to
prevent, work around or compensate or otherwise minimize the effect of such delays.
The party asserting force majeure shall, in each instance, give the other party written
notice, within a reasonable time after knowledge thereof, of the beginning of each
period of delay. Such notice should include a brief description of the events or
circumstances of force majeure and an estimate of the anticipated delay. Either party
may terminate this Agreement upon written notice if the period of delay lasts for more
than ten (10) calendar days.

Date:__________________________________

Signatures of Agreement

Name:_________________________________

Title:__________________________________


